F\MIASANFOR\SANFOR_072.XML

AMENDMENT TO H.R. 4937

OFFERED BY MR. SANFORD OF SOUTH CAROLINA

In section 2(a)(1)(B)—

(1)  strike  “$128,000,000”
“$124,500,000’; and

(2)  strike  “$41,885,000”
“$39,385,0007.

In section 2(a)(1)(C)—

(1) strike  “$131,000,000”
“$124,500,000’; and

(2)  strike  “$44,885,000”
“$39,385,000".

In section 2(a)(1)(D)—

(1) strike  “$134,000,000”
“$124,500,000; and

(2)  strike  “$47,885,000”
“$39,385,000.

and

and

and

and

and

and

msert

msert

msert

msert

msert

msert

In section 2(a)(2)(C), strike “$23,000,000” and in-

sert “$22,123,000”.

In section 2(a)(2)(D), strike “$23,000,000” and in-

sert “$22.123,000".

f:\WHLC\041916\041916.109.xml (62870812)

April 19, 2016 (11:21 a.m.)



F\MI14SANFOR\SANFOR_072. XML
2
In section 2(b)(2), strike “$22,000,000” and insert
“$21,000,000".

In section 2(b)(3), strike “$22,000,000” and insert
“$21,000,000.

In section 2(b)(4), strike “$23,000,000” and insert
“$21,000,000".

fAVHLC\041916\041916.109.xml (62870812)
April 19, 2016 (11:21 a.m.)




  
   F:\M14\SANFOR\SANFOR_072.XML 4/19/2016 11:21 04/19/2016 09:07  
 1142-0419-013400 628708|2
  
 
 [Discussion Draft] 
 
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
  
 
  
  
 114th CONGRESS  2d Session 
 Amendment to H.R. 4937 
  
 Offered by  Mr. Sanford of South Carolina 
  
 
 
    
  In section 2(a)(1)(B)—
  (1) strike  $128,000,000 and insert  $124,500,000; and
  (2) strike  $41,885,000 and insert  $39,385,000.  
  In section 2(a)(1)(C)—
  (1) strike  $131,000,000 and insert  $124,500,000; and
  (2) strike  $44,885,000 and insert  $39,385,000.  
  In section 2(a)(1)(D)—
  (1) strike  $134,000,000 and insert  $124,500,000; and
  (2) strike  $47,885,000 and insert  $39,385,000.  
  In section 2(a)(2)(C), strike  $23,000,000 and insert  $22,123,000.   
  In section 2(a)(2)(D), strike  $23,000,000 and insert  $22,123,000.   
  In section 2(b)(2), strike  $22,000,000 and insert  $21,000,000.   
  In section 2(b)(3), strike  $22,000,000 and insert  $21,000,000.   
  In section 2(b)(4), strike  $23,000,000 and insert  $21,000,000.  

