F\MIA\CAPUAN\CAPUAN_047. XML

AMENDMENT TO H.R. 5303

OFFERED BY MR. CAPUANO OF MASSACHUSETTS

At the end of title I, add the following:

f\VHLC\052316\052316.295.xml
May 23, 2016 (3:54 p.m.)

. . HARBOR DEEPENING.

Section 101(a)(1) of the Water Resources Develop-

ment Act of 1986 (33 U.S.C. 2211(a)(1)) 1s amended—

(1) in the matter preceding subparagraph (A)
by striking “the date of enactment of this Act” and
inserting ‘“‘the date of enactment of the Water Re-
sources Reform and Development Act of 2014 (Pub-
lic Law 113-121; 128 Stat. 1193)"’;

(2) in subparagraph (B) by striking “45 feet”
and inserting “50 feet”’; and

(3) in subparagraph (C) by striking “45 feet”
and inserting “50 feet”.

(63316411)




  
   F:\M14\CAPUAN\CAPUAN_047.XML 5/23/2016 15:54 05/23/2016 15:48    633164|1  
 
 [Discussion Draft] 
 
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
  
 
  
  
 114th CONGRESS  2d Session 
 Amendment to H.R. 5303 
  
 Offered by  Mr. Capuano of Massachusetts 
  
 
 
    
  At the end of title I, add the following:
 
  __. Harbor deepening Section 101(a)(1) of the Water Resources Development Act of 1986 (33 U.S.C. 2211(a)(1)) is amended— 
  (1) in the matter preceding subparagraph (A) by striking  the date of enactment of this Act and inserting  the date of enactment of the Water Resources Reform and Development Act of 2014 (Public Law 113–121; 128 Stat. 1193); 
  (2) in subparagraph (B) by striking  45 feet and inserting  50 feet; and 
  (3) in subparagraph (C) by striking  45 feet and inserting  50 feet. 
 

